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Dismantling Ableism
Promoting a Culture of Diversity, Equity, Inclusion, and Accessibility 
for Nurses With Disabilities

Diversity, equity, inclusion, and 
accessibility (DEIA) initiatives 
have been in the spotlight in the 

United States in the wake of the corona-
virus disease 2019 pandemic. DEIA ini-
tiatives in nursing oft en focus on critical 
issues, including race, ethnicity, socio-
economic status, sexual orientation, and 
gender identity.

Notably absent from DEIA conversa-
tions in health care is a large and growing 
population in the United States—people 
with disabilities (PWD). PWD are all but 
invisible within health care, and nursing 
is no exception. Articles on diversity in 
nursing and holistic admissions to nurs-
ing programs frequently do not incor-
porate disability in the context of DEIA. 
Th is glaring omission underscores a per-
vasive oversight in the current discourse. 
As doctorally prepared nurses involved 
with promoting disability awareness, we 
propose that disability needs to be part of 
diversity initiatives.

People with disabilities across the 
spectrum face signifi cant health dispari-
ties (World Health Organization, 2023), 
including disproportionately high rates 
of mental health conditions, such as anx-
iety and depression (Centers for Disease 
Control and Prevention [CDC], 2023b). 
In 2023, the National Institutes of Health 
(2023) designated PWD as a popula-
tion who experience signifi cant health 
disparities. PWD comprise 16% of the 
world’s population, or 1.3 billion people 
(CDC, 2023a). In the United States, an 
estimated 26% of the total population 
(one in four adults) has a disability, mak-
ing PWD the largest single group facing 
health disparities (CDC, 2023a). More 

than 4.3 million RNs are estimated to 
be living with a disability (Baker et al., 
2023). Yet, in academic nursing pro-
grams and health care services, nurses 
with disabilities face overwhelming and 
unaddressed barriers to education and 
practice.

Why is disability oft en overlooked 
in DEIA initiatives in nursing? As a 
number of authors (Eisenmenger, 2019; 
Kaundinya & Schroth, 2022; Neil-Boylan 
& Miller, 2020; Yerbury & Yerbury, 2021) 
on this topic emphasize, nurses must ac-
knowledge another kind of “ism” central 
to disability discussions—ableism. Able-
ism is a socially constructed system that 
devalues and discriminates against peo-
ple living with disabilities and classifi es 
people with disabilities across the spec-
trum as inherently inferior or “less than.”

Ableism, whether conscious or not, 
oft en leads to psychological distress 
for PWD, more so than disability itself 
(Douglas, 2023). Examples of ableism 
are rampant in health care, and range 
from ostensibly benevolent to blatantly 
hostile behavior, or more ambivalent 
and mixed expressions of discrimina-
tion (Nario-Redmond et al., 2019). Bias 
toward those with disabilities, which is 
inherently ableist, results in substantial 
barriers to participation and active en-
gagement of PWD in diversifying the 
nursing workforce.

Entrenched ableism throughout 
health care may be one of the reasons 
why disability is excluded from discus-
sions on diversity in nursing. Examples 
of ableism are rife within our own nurs-
ing organizations. For instance, a leading 
national nursing organization, despite 

claiming promotion of diversity, recently 
held a public webinar on overcoming 
barriers to DEIA in nursing without 
mentioning disability. Furthermore, the 
webinar was not made accessible for 
PWD until an advocacy group inter-
vened.

Omnipresent structural and system-
atic entrenchment of ableism in nursing 
results in obstacles for students with dis-
abilities who are interested in pursuing 
nursing as a career. Lack of universal 
design and conformity with the stan-
dards of the Americans With Disabili-
ties Act (ADA) are major obstacles to 
highly qualifi ed individuals in nursing 
programs (Marks & Sisirak, 2022). In-
accessible learning platforms are major 
deterrents to the ability to act on diver-
sity and inclusion in nursing education. 
Unfounded concerns about safety have 
led to the exclusion of highly qualifi ed 
individuals from the nursing profession 
(Neal-Boylan & Miller, 2020). Nurses 
with disabilities who are employed in ac-
ademia face similar battles. Although not 
specifi c to nursing, Yerbury and Yerbury 
(2021) identifi ed that people working in 
academia may hesitate to disclose their 
disability for fear of stigmatization. 

Rather than focusing on limitations 
related to disability, we should celebrate 
and support the unique perspectives and 
approaches nurses with disabilities bring 
to the profession. As Marks and Sisirak 
(2022) suggested, “nurses with disability 
have enormous potential to transform 
healthcare from a medicalized view of 
disability as inherently negative to a 
marker of diversity and the hallmark of 
equitable care” (para. 1). Th is approach 
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is a pivotal step in providing culturally 
competent care for patients experienc-
ing disabilities themselves, as caring for 
patients with disabilities requires inno-
vative approaches to incorporating dis-
ability in nursing curricula (Morrison et 
al., 2021). Patients with disabilities may 
receive more empathy and feel more un-
derstood when cared for by nurses with 
disabilities. Nursing students with dis-
abilities can also benefi t from role mod-
els of faculty and practicing nurses with 
disabilities, drawing on their adaptabil-
ity, resourcefulness, and creativity, which 
can off er novel perspectives to colleagues 
and patients.

In 2021, the Biden administration ap-
proved an executive order incorporating 
the term accessibility into the DEIA ac-
ronym, emphasizing the signifi cance of 
accessibility in creating equity. Although 
this order specifi cally targets the federal 
workforce, it underscores the impor-
tance of accessibility, especially for PWD. 
Without accessibility, true inclusion re-
mains unattainable.

We recommend scrutinizing edu-
cational and workplace DEIA policies 
and initiatives to ensure that PWD are 
equally represented among marginal-
ized populations. Increased recognition 
of the individualized nature of the dis-
ability experience is warranted, as people 
with the same type of disability have 
varied preferences and needs. Further, 
disability is part of the life experience, as 
an increased prevalence of disabilities is 
associated with aging. A growing older 
adult population will require nurses to be 
astute and sensitive professionals, using 
a comprehensive and informed approach 
to assessment of those living with invis-
ible and visible disabilities. Valuable re-
sources for nursing include the National 
Organization of Nurses With Disabilities 
(www.nond.org) and Meeks’ and Neal-
Boylan’s (2020) book, Disability as Diver-

sity, directed toward health professions, 
including nursing. 

In the words of nurse theorist Sister 
Callista Roy, humans are united through 
understanding diverse experiences (Roy 
& Andrews, 1999). Including disability 
in DEIA initiatives is essential for truly 
inclusive eff orts. Disability, although of-
ten invisible, must not remain unseen 
within the context of diversity. Nurses, as 
advocates for patients, are ideally posi-
tioned to embrace and champion disabil-
ity awareness as a necessary and positive 
element of diversity initiatives.
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